Introduced by: The Council President
At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)

Prepared by: Department of Legislative Reference Date: March 15, 2017
Referred to: JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS Committee

Also referred for recommendation and report to municipal agencies listed on reverse.

ciry Counei/ 7- ¢o3 3

A BILL ENTITLED
AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”

FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an 6utdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by
the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments
Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code
(2015 Edition)

**The introduction of an Ordinance or Resolution by Counclimembers at the

request of any person, firm or organization Is a courtesy extended by the
Councilmembers and not an indication of their position.

1050-14- 1 REV. 1003

LY o S |



HIETT g ) 1))

1310 HI10

A0 110

UGISSIIIWOy) I3vAN 19184g Juau;a.lyau Sazhojduy
uoissiunmo)) dujuueg AN{IqBUIBISNS UO HOISSIEIWGD)

pleog Aoy durieg UO01)BAL3SIL [BANIINNYILY PUE |BIIL0)SIH 10 “UHLOD)

J2U0ISSIWO.) J0ge] sigaddy utuoz pue jeddiunyy jo pisog
wsg Jnawainay safodust aod » g sJY)q Jo pauod
pieog [01Ju07} [B)USMIUOIIATS 53)BWISTH JO pieoy

SUOISSTHIMIO,) PuUB Sp.IEog

41O YO

HET o X 430

yuaunysedaq anjod I3PO

J0KRIAl 3] JO ANJJOQ T Buruueld jo yuawgiedag

{3ojomyoa |, uonpewtiojuy Jjo DYJQ S, J0AR[ T $321N053) urmWIngy jo Juauiedaq

52J1AI3S UBUINH JO 321J() S, J0AB[A] juawdopaaaqg Anunwwo) pus Suisnopy jo yuaunyiedag

juswdopaaq juawdorduy Jo 33yjQ S 048I — §301A13§ (812835 Jo Juwlieda(g
awpaedaq qjesy - adusuly jo pusunjsedagg

juaupaedaq ang supny jo juswiedag ~

uoneydodsues] jo jwdwpedaq — 21O S 3jondwoy

I8 PUE WOITE2L9Y Jo Juawpasdag ™ 103108 AJ;;)T
e)sy ey Jo juawndvdaq uopeaodio) yuamdopaaag 2dompeg

SHA0M 2[qng jJo yjuaunaedaqg ™~ WasAS [00Yag dngng Ay alomnjeg —

Sa10UABY



oW

\D OO0 =3 O Lh

t1

12

13

14

15

16
17

18

19

20
21

CITY OF BALTIMORE
OrDINANCE4 7 - 01 7
Council Bill 17-0033

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: March 20, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

Committee Report: Favorable

Council action: Adopted

Read second time: April 24, 2017

AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”
FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modem definition adopted by

the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore Cify Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part I1. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction
Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

]
EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law. m

ECEIVER

[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law. ‘
Underlining indicates matter added to the bill by amendment.
Btrike-ont indicates matter stricken from the bill by M AY 1 g 201-’
amendment or deleted from existing law by amendment.
BALTIMORE CITY COUNGCIL

BFRebI 700 It PRESIDENT'S OFFICE |




10
11

Council Bill 17-0033

202.2.35 [High-rise building. “High-rise building” has the meaning stated in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.] {VACANT}

Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.]

[Exception: {Not Adopted})

[403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {ds in IBC}

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day

after the date 1t is enacted.

Certified as duly passed this day of

~ President, Balishor

Certificd as duly delivered to Her Honor, the Mayor,

this___ dayof_ MAY (8 2007

Approved this /{{  day of M% ,20_{7

App Form and Legal Sufficiency
This ﬁ?’Dayof Maﬂﬂ .

_ Plima R DPutw
Chief Sollcitor

el 7B 45(2)-Ind O APTET 2
BFR/chI7-0013-3rd/aa-nix = =




BALTIMORE CITY COUNC.
JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS COMMITTEE
VOTING RECORD

BILL#  CC-17-0033 DATE: -4 -|7

BILL TITLE: Building Code - Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”

MOTIONBY:  SLOTT SECONDED BY:  PINKEIT

@ FAVORABLE [ ] FAVORABLE WITH AMENDMENTS

[ ] UNFAVORABLE ] WITHOUT RECOMMENDATION
NAME YEAS NAYS ABSENT | ABSTAIN
Costello, E., Chair E Q g L__|
Clarke, M., Vice Chair g g g
Bullock, J. |Z’ g g g
Pinkett, L. X1 [l (] O
Reisinger, E. E Q g g
Scott, B. X1 [ ] L] []
Stokes, R. g Q l;l
- L] L L L]
: L] L] L] []
2 L] L] L] L]
: L] L] L L]
. [] L] L L]
o L L L L]
: B o L] L]
3 L] L] L L]
i L] L] L] L]
g L] [ L] L
g L L L [
: [ ] [ ] ] [ ]

[ ons[ T 1 T ]

CHAIRPERSON:  _~-<J-
COMMITTEE STAFF: D'Paul S. Nibber, Initials: ____}J %







CATHERINE L MUGH, Moyor

|
CITY OF BALTIMORE ( 5 A\
' |

HEARING NOTES

Bill: 17-0033

Building Code - Correcting Definition of "High-Rise Building"

Committee: Judiciary and Legislative Inveétigations
Chaired By: Councilmember Eric Costello

Hearing Date: April 4, 2017

Time (Beginning): 9:55 a.m.

Time (Ending): 10:05 a.m.

Location: Clarence "Du" Bumns Chamber

Total Attendance; ~10

Committee Members in Attendance:

Mary Pat Clarke John Bullock Brandon Scott

Leon Pinkett Robert Stokes Eric Costello Edward Reisinger

Bill Synopsis il the fIle? .......c.cveeeremsermsessessssssssssssssmsssssensssessasssssasasssassoses yes [Ino [Jn/a
Attendance sheet in the flle? ......rerremeereenssmsssessssssssssssssssesssssessssssne - yes [Ino [Jn/a
AZENCY FEPOTES FEAA? vvrerrersmnssrsasssensssesssssnssstssnsessssssssssassassesnsasesssnssasssssns MXyes [Ino [In/a
Hearing televised or audio-digitally recorded? ......c..ccoovversnsansnencres [[] yes no [Jwa
Certification of advertising/posting notices in the file?................... [lyes [Inoe Xw/a
Evidence of notification to property 0wWners? .........ccececcenecrnenseeressees [lyes [(Ono Xn/a
Final vote taken at this hearing? .......ccocevsscnecrirsssssessssessssssnsssssssssssssases wXyes [Ino [In/a
MOtIONEd DY: .uccriiiiiiiiiiniiiisnsensssnssnssenssessssneassssessessessassrnssansenssssessenssassasses Councilmember Scott
Seconded DY: wociiiireerinsisasnssnsnssssossessesaessessssssnsonssesssassasssssssasassassssns <eeees COuNcilmember Pinkett
Final Vote: .....ucenirenrisnssicisanssnnas R Favorable

Major Speakers

(This is not an attendance record.)
# Sharon Daboin, Department of Housing and Community Development

®-






1. Chairman Costello introduced the proceedings and asked if each of the agencies stood by their

Major Issues Discussed

reports, with each agency responding in the affirmative.

2. Ms. Sharon Daboin discussed the purpose of the Bill and why it is needed. She stated that the
current code is not very clear as to what constitutes a "High-Rise Building." Ms. Daboin added
the International Building Code is much clearer and provides for a

that the newest version of

definition of buildings larger than 75 feet.

3. Councilwoman Clarke asked about new building requirements regarding sprinklers, and was
told that this is based on state law. She was also told that the sprinkler requirement is based on the
. According to Maryland code, the requirement currently applies to
buildings between 45 to 75 feet, whereas the new International Building Code requirements would

size of a proposed building

clarify the size requirement and apply to all new buildings.

Was further study requested?

Further Study

[:l Yes No

If yes, describe.
Committee Vote:

E. COSLELIO: cuvrerirrreersrrnesserserarsarseresessrnessosssssassssosssssassssssssssssssassassssssasssssssone ... Yea
M. ClATKE: coerrerserensensaneeseescssesransssasssenssssensasassessassonsasasnses saseseresrensessenssssessaseases Yea
J. BUllOCK eeeereeesseersesseaseraceassnsensrasascanas GemenmeesessesessasRensERRSIssasusbOasasssssaserasenss Yea
L. PINKELL: cecrerieieccsessuasscsssersrsssnsnssssonsnssersossassssassasassosasssonsssssnasssnsassssssnssssssasan Yea
E. REISINEEL: veceresrrsrnsrrsrasnsrsssssrsssssssserssssasssssssessenaesassarernoasernsssssasasssnesasssassses Yea
B, S COI: sevrerreerarsrassorsassrenssssossnssrsrsssesessesrsnessressssensossasassnsassssonsanssnsasssasasssnss e YEA
R SLOKES? veerrneerernensnnesssenssaserussessansssssnsossssssssssssssssessonsssssnsss resrsssenrensessensssensres Yea

DL hblo
D'Paul Nibber, Committee Staff

cc: Bill File
OCS Chrono File

Hearing Notes
Page 2 of 2

Date: April 21, 2017



te e T
E R R




§ 8-401, Right of mobtllty-impairzd- residents to request..,, MD PUBLIC SAFETY...

West's Annotated Code of Maryland
Public Safety (Refs & Annos)
Title g. Fire Protection and Prevention
Subtitle 4. High-Rise Building Safety in Case of Fire

MD Cade, Public Safety, § 9-401
Formerly cited as MD CODE Art. 384, §4¢

§ g-401. Right of mobility-impaired residents to request lower floor units
Effective: October 1, 2011
Currentness
In generul

(a) In this subtitle the following words have the meanings indicated.

G- 4~ 17

High-rise building

{b){1} ~High-rise building” means a building for human occupancy that is:
(i) four or more stories above grade level: or
(ii) over 43 [eet in height.
{2) “High-nise building™ dees not include:;
(1) a structure or building used exclusively for open air parking: or
(11) a building used exclusively for agricultural purposes.

Local fire department

() “Local fire department” means a career or volunteer fire department.

Mobility impaired

(d) "Mobility impaired™ means unable to carry objects or to move or travel without the use of an assistive device or
service animal.

Public way

(¢} "Public way™ means a paved thoroughfare over 21 feet in width that:

WESTLAW

FTTachmenT A






9-401. Right of mobility-impai esidents to request..., MD PUBLIC SAFETY/
y-impaligasidan LIC SAFETY(

(1) is located on privatcly owned and privately maintained property but is designated for public use; or
{2} is publicly owned and publicly maintained.

Credits
Added by Acts 2003, . 5, § 2, eff. Oct. 1, 2003. Amended by Acts 2011, ¢. 596, § 1, eff. Oct. 1, 2011,

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-401, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-401
Current through all legisiation from the 2016 Regular Session of the General Assembly

WESTLAW






§ 9-402, Purpose of subtitle; le tive findings, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-402 |

West's Annotated Code of Maryland
Public Safety (Refs & Annos)
Title 9. Fire Protection and Prevention
Subtitle 4. High-Rise Building Safety in Case of Fire

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-g402
Formerly cited as MD CODE Art. 38A, §48

§ 9-402. Purpose of subtitle; legislative findings

Currentness

Purpose of subtitle

{a) The purpose of this subtitle is to provide for the physical salety and protection of property of occupants of high-
risc buildings in case of firc.

Legislative findings

(b)(1) Without adequate protection, residents of high-rise buildings are dependent on descending multiple flights of steps
or jumping from windows when a fire occurs.

(2) For many elderly residents of high-rise buildings, this is physically impossible.

(3) Most fire fighting and rescue operations are also conducted inside the high-rise buitding. where there are greater
obstacles to rescuing occupants and controlling and extinguishing the fire

(4} Many tragedies could be avoided by installation of automatic fire extinguishing equipment in these situations,
usually at no great additional cost to builders.

Credits
Added by Acts 2003, c. 3,§ 2, eff. Oct. 1, 2003.

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-402, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9402
Current through all legislation from the 2016 Regular Session of the General Assembly

Fied wob Thoisutne i ; Sriiin JE

WESTLAW






§ 9-403, Automatic sprinkler sy, 2 requirad, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-403

West's Annotated Code of Maryland
Public Safety (Refs & Annos)
Title 9. Fire Protection and Prevention
Subtitle 4. High-Rise Building Safety in Case of Fire

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-403
Formerly cited as MD CODE Art. 384, §49;MD CODE Art. 384, §50

§ 9-403. Automatic sprinkler system required

Currentness

In general
(a} Each high-rise building constructed after July 1. 1974, shall be protected by a complete automatic sprinkler system

installed in accordance with accepted engincering practices as approved by the authority with jurisdiction.

Exception

(b)(1) This section does not apply to a building that is less than 73 feet in height above grade fevel if:

(i) the focal fire department has at least one approved first line piece of aerial equipment that is capable of reaching
the roof of the building; and

{ii) accessibility to the building is provided on two sides of the perimeter of the building by a public way that is:
1. Kept uccessible at all times 1o the local fire department; and
2. close enough to the building to allow the fire department acrial equipment to reach 75 feet in height.

{2) For purposes of this subsection. height above grade level shall be determined by using the lowest elevation of the
public way as a reference datum.

Credits
Added by Acts 2003, c. 5, § 2, eff. Oct. 1, 2003.

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-403, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-403
Current through all legislation from the 2016 Regular Session of the General Assembly

Eed el Ducnama s | B A

WESTLAW






§ 9-404. Appeal of orders for cc]r “ance, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-404 (

West's Annotated Code of Marvland
Public Safety (Refs & Annos)
Title 9. Fire Protection and Prevention
Subtitle 4. High-Rise Building Safety in Case of Fire

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-404
Formerly cited as MD CODE Art. 384, §50

§ 9-404. Appeal of orders for compliance

Currentness

Appeal to State Fire Prevention Commission

{a) An order for compliance with the requirements of § 9-403 of this subtitle that is issued in accordance with the awthority
granted under Title 6, Subtitle 3 of this article may be appealed 1o the State Fire Prevention Commission.

Appeal to local authority
{b) An order for compliance with the requirements of § 9-403 of this subtitle that is issued in accordance with the authority

granted by a local law, ordinance, or regulation may be appealed as provided by law, ordinance, or regulation of the
local jurisdiction.

Credits
Added by Acts 2003, c. 3, § 2, eft. OcL. [, 2003,

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-404, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-404
Current through all legislation from the 2016 Regular Session of the General Assembly

brdal [ha

WESTLAW






§ 9-405. Right of mobility-impai»~ “residents to request..., MD PUBLIC SAFETY;

West's Annotated Code of Maryland
Public Safety (Refs & Annos)
Title 9. Fire Protection and Prevention
Subtitle 4. High-Rise Building Safety in Case of Fire

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-405
§ 9-403. Right of mobility-impaired residents to request lower floor units

Effective: October 1, 2011
Currentness

For fire safety purposes, the owner of a residential high-rise building with reatal units shall provide reasonable written
notice annually to all residents of the residential high-rise building to inform residents who are mobility impaired of their
right to request a rental unit on the first five Roors of the high-rise building if one should become available.

Credits
Added by Acts 2011, c. 396, § 1, eff. Oct. 1, 2011,

MD Code, Public Safety, § 9-4035, MD PUBLIC SAFETY § 9-403
Current through all legislation from the 2016 Regular Session of the General Assembly

CWESTLAW






CITY OF BALTIMOI

CitY COUNCIL HEARING ATTEN]

Committee; Judiciary and Legislative Investigations

Date: April 4, 2017

| Time: 9:35 _ . | Place:

m:chonn Ordinance - _w.:_a::m Code - Oo....on:amlunwm:m:o: of :m:m_TEmm _w__m_.::mm

PLEASE PRINT

IF YOU WANT TO TESTIFY PLEASE

FIRST NAME

LAST NAME

ST.#

ADDRESS/ORGANIZATION NAME

YA

John

Doe

100

North Charles Street

2121







BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS
COMMITTEE

Mission Statement

On behalf of the Citizens of Baltimore City, the mission of the Judiciary and
Legislative Investigations Commiittee is to investigate and study the continuing
operations, efficiency, and functions of Baltimore City government in accordance
with the laws of Baltimore City, the State of Maryland, and the United States,

As a result of its investigations and studies, the Committee will recommend and

oversee reforms to improve the operations of Baltimore City's government through
legislative, administrative, and/or budgetary processes.

The Honorable Eric T. Costello
Chairman

PUBLIC HEARING

Tuesday, April 4, 2017
9:35 AM
CLARENCE "DU" BURNS COUNCIL CHAMBERS

Council Bill 17-0033

Building Code - Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”



CITY COUNCIL COMMITTEES

BUDGET AND APPROPRIATIONS
Eric Costello = Chair
Leon Pinkett — Vice Chair
Bill Henry
Sharon Green Middleton
Brandon M. Scott
Isaac *Yitzy" Schieifer
Shannon Sneed
Staff: Marguerite Murray

EDUCATION AND YOUTH
Zeke Cohen — Chair
Mary Pat Clarke — Vice Chair
John Bullock
Kristerfer Bumett
Ryan Dorsey

Staff: D'Paul Nibber

EXECUTIVE APPOINTMENTS
Robert Stokes — Chair
Kristerfer Burnett— Vice Chair
Mary Pat Clarke
Zeke Cohen
Isaac "Yitzy" Schleifer

Staff: Jennifer Coafes

HOUSING AND URBAN AFFAIRS
John Bullock — Chair
Isaac *Yitzy” Schleifer — Vice Chair
Kristerfer Burnett
Bill Henry
Shannon Sneed
Zeke Cohen
Ryan Dorsey
Staff: Richard Krummerich

JUDICIARY AND_LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS

Eric Costello — Chair
Mary Pat Clarke - Vice Chair
John Bullock
Leon Pinkett
Ed Reisinger
Brandon Scott
Robert Stokes
Staff: D'Paul Nibber

Rev. 1/3/17

LABOR
Shannon Sneed — Chair
Robert Stokes = Vice Chair
Eric Costello
Bill Henry
Mary Pat Clarke

Staff: Marguerite Murray

LAND USE AND TRANSPORTATION
Edward Reisinger - Chair
Sharon Green Middleton — Vice Chair
Mary Pat Clarke
Eric Costello
Ryan Dorsey
Leon Pinkett
Robert Stokes
Staff: Marshall Bell

PUBLIC SAFETY

Brandon Scott — Chair

Ryan Dorsey — Vice Chair

Kristerfer Burnett

Shannon Sneed

Zeke Cohen

Leon Pinkett

Isaac “Yitzy" Schieifer
Staff: Marshall Bell

TAXATION, FINANCE AND ECONOMIC
DEVELOPMENT
Sharon Green Middleton — Chair
Leon Pinkett — Vice Chair
Erick Costello
Edward Reisinger
Robert Stokes
Staff: Jennifer Coates
- Larry Greene (pension only)




CATHI RINL L PUGH, Moyor

x'- I“l
CITY OF BALTIMORE ( % \ |

BILL SYNOPSIS

Committee: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations

Bili 17-0033

Building Code - Correcting Definition Of “"High-Rise Building”

Sponsor: President Young, et al
Introduced: March 20, 2017

Purpose:

For the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted
by the International Building Code.

Effective: Upon the 30th day after the date it is enacted

Hearing Date/Time/Location: April 4, 2017/9:35 a.m./Clarence "Du" Burns Chamber

Agency Reports

Department of Housing and Community Development Favorable
Department of Law Favorable



ANALYSIS

Current Law
The current definition of “high-rise building” is included in Baltimore City’s Building, Fire, and
Related Codes, § 202 and § 403.

Background

Council Bill 17-0033 revises the definition of "high-rise building" in accordance with the most
recent revision of the Internation Building Code. It deletes current language in the City's
"Building, Fire, and Related Codes" referencing State Public Safety Article § 9-401. The Bill
also adopts sections 403.1 to 403.4 from the International Building Code. According to the
Department of Housing and Community Development ("Housing"), this language "includes
guidance on the construction of high rise buildings, including fire-resistance rating, seismic
considerations, structural integrity of exit enclosures and elevator hoistway enclosures,
sprinkler systems, and emergency systems."

Both Housing and the Law Department provided favorable reports for 17-0033.

Bill Synopsis 17-0033
Page 2 of 3



Additional Information

Fiscal Note: Not Available

Information Source(s): Department of Housing and Community Development; Law
Department

PPul b Niten
Analysis by: D'Paul S. Nibber Direct Inquiries to: (410) 396-1268
Analysis Date: March 31, 2017

Bill Synopsis 17-0033
Page 3 of 3



14

15

16

17
18

19

20

21
22

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CounciL BILL 17-0033
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: March 20, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development

A BILL ENTITLED
AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”
FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modem definition adopted by

the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part I1. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction
Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added te existing law.
|Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.

dir] 7-0145(2}- 15/ 16Mar] 7
BFR/cbl7-0033~ Lst/an:nbr



)

10
11

12
13

Council Bill 17-0033
202.2.35 [High-rise building. “High-rise building” has the meaning stated in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.] {VA4CANT}
Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “*high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.]

[Exception: {Not Adopted}]
[403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {Asin IBC}
SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior

Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day
after the date it is enacted.

diL7-0345(2)~ 15/ 16Mar] 7 2
BFR/cbl7.0033~1st/aambx T e



JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE
INVESTIGATIONS COMMITTEE

Council Bill 17-0033
Hearing Date: April 4, 2017

Agency Reports:

Department of Housing and Community Development
o  Favorable

Department of Law

o  Favorable



BALTIMORE MEMORANDUM

HOUSING To:  The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
ksl c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

Acting Comunsioner, H( T

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN . . .
Actings Cvevurne Psccror, 11ABC - From: Michael Braverman, Acting Commissioner @

Date: March 24, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 - Building Code — Carrecting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0033, for the purpose of deleting from the City Building
Code an outdated definition of “high-rise building”, thereby conforming that
term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by the Intemational
Building Code.

If enacted, this bill would update the outdated ianguage in the City BFR Codes by
modifying Sections 202 and 403 that references Public Safety Article §9-401, to
incorporate Section 403 of the International Building Code (IBC), which is
current and more consistent with national codes.

Section 403 of the IBC includes guidance on the construction of high rise
buildings, including fire-resistance rating, seismic considerations, structural
integrity of exit enclosures and elevator hoistway enclosures, sprinkler systems,
and emergency systems.

The Department of Housing and Community Development encourages the
passage of City Council Bill 17-0033.

MB:sd

cc: Ms. Karen Stokes, Mayor'’s Office aof Governmens Relations D I E @ E ﬂ W] E

Mr. Kyron Banks, Mayor ‘s Office of Government Relations :
I f'nj J:'. 1 |:.: 7 _-'
< BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

O

L

417 East Fayetre Street - Balumore, MD 21202 * MD Reby 711 « TTY 410 547 9247 - BaltimoreHousing org
Hakimore Homing nefleas the combmed ofert of the Houting Authoriey of Dalumore Citv and the Dakimore Chv Desaronent of Howlos and Comarumey Develonment




DEPARTMENT OF LAW

101 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE

CATHERINE E, PUGH, Mayor

March 29, 2017

The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Attn: Natawna B. Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hall
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 — Building Code — Correcting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0033 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill deletes from the City Building Code an outdated definition of
“high-rise building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modem definition
adopted by the International Building Code.

Sincerely,

%/L e b

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

ce:  David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor's Office of Government Relations
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division

Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor

_

Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor !-D‘)l ECEJVE D

\
|j|_ MAR 30 2017 |

PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

é BALTIMORE CiTY COUNCIL

@ Pninted on recycled paper with environmentally friendly soy based ink.



DEPARTMENT OF LAW

101 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE

CATHERINE E. PUGH, Mayor

March 29, 2017

The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Attn: Natawna B. Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hall
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 - Building Code — Correcting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0033 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill deletes from the City Building Code an outdated definition of
“high-rise building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition
adopted by the International Building Code.

Sincerely,

%,L, el

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

cc: David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division

Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor .
Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor @ IE @ E “ M E
=
l_[ L MAR 30 2017
i
BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
PHESIDENT'S OFFICE

@ Printed on recycled paper with environmentally friendly soy based ink,






BALTIMORE MEMORANDUM
HOUSING To.

The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
CATHERINE PUGH c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN ) ) .
Acting Dxecutive Thrector, 11ABC— From: Michee] Braverman, Acting Commissioner @

Acting Conunissioner, H( D

Date: March 24, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 - Building Code - Correcting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0033, for the purpose of deleting from the City Building
Code an outdated definition of “high-rise building”, thereby conforming that
term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by the Intemational
Building Code.

If enacted, this bill would update the outdated language in the City BFR Codes by
modifying Sections 202 and 403 that references Public Safety Article §9-401, to
incorporate Section 403 of the International Building Code (IBC), which is
current and more consistent with national codes.

Section 403 of the IBC includes guidance on the construction of high rise
buildings, including fire-resistance rating, seismic considerations, structural
integrity of exit enclosures and elevator hoistway enclosures, sprinkler systems,
and emergency systems.

The Department of Housing and Community Development encourages the
passage of City Council Bill 17-0033.

MB:sd )
cc: Ms, Karen Stokes, Mayor's Office of Government Relaitit’m's
Mr. Kyron Banks, Mayor s Office of Government Relations

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

*@ﬁ@EﬂMED

1

417 East Fayette Street « Baldmore, MD 21202 * MD Rehlay 711 < TTY 410 547 9247 * BaltimoreHousing.otg
HBakimore Howbne reflecs the combined offarn of the Howring Authority of Baltimare Citv and the Hakimone City Department of Howing and Comnmumty Develodment.

Ty







Lh

14

15

16

17
18

19

20

21
22

CI1TY OF BALTIMORE
CounciL BiLL 17-0033
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: March 20, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committec

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development

A BILL ENTITLED

AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”
FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by

the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part I1. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction

Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law,
[Brackets] indicate matter delcted from existing law.

il 7-0145(2)~ 130/ 16Martl 7
DBFR/chI7-0033~1sl/aanbr



Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.)

[Exception: {Not Adopted}]
(403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {As in IBC}
SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior

Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day
after the date it is enacted.

dir 17145 (2 intro/L SMarl? 5
BER/High-RiseBldgs/anmo ik [






ACTION BY THE CITY COUNCIL

MAR 2 0 2017
20

FIRST READING (INTRODUCTION)

PUBLIC HEARING HELD ON APRTL e 20 {1/
COMMITTEE REPORT AS OF APRTL Y% 20 1]
_ X ravoraeLe UNFAVORABLE FAVORABLE AS AMENDED WITHOUT RECOMMENDATION
| O o
Chair
COMMITTEE MEMBERS: COMMITTEE MEMBERS:

SECOND READING: The Council's action being favorable (unfavorable), this City Council bill was (was not) ordered printed for

Third Reading on: APR 2 4 201_(
20

____ Amendments were read and adopted {defeated) as indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

THIRD READING MAY 0 §02017

Amendments were read and adopted (defeated) as indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

THIRD READING (ENROLLED) 20
Amendments were read and adopted (defeated) as indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

/
THIRD READING (RE-ENROLLED) 20 _._,-"

!

i

WITHDRAWAL

There being no objections to the request for withdrawal, it was so ordered that this City Council Ordinance br
from the files of the City Council.

10N, Desok

President ST Chief Clark




DEPARTMENT OF LAW

101 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE

CATHERINE E, PUGH, Mayor

March 29, 2017

The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Attn: Natawna B. Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hall
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 - Building Code — Correcting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0033 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill deletes from the City Building Code an outdated definition of
“high-rise building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition
adopted by the International Building Code.

Sincerely,

%,,L e b

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

cc: David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor's Office of Government Relatier
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division
Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor
Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor

/‘P






BALTIMORE MEMORANDUM

HOUSING To:  The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
E&;?ENNB PUGH c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN . . P
Acting Exeeutive Director, HABC From: Michael Braverman, Acnng Commissioner @

Acring Conmussioner, HU 12

Date: March 24, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0033 - Building Code - Correcting Definition of
“High-Rise Building”

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0033, for the purpose of deleting from the City Building
Code an outdated definition of “high-rise building”, thereby conforming that
term’s meaning to the more modem definition adopted by the International
Building Code.

If enacted, this bill would update the outdated language in the City BFR Codes by
modifying Sections 202 and 403 that references Public Safety Article §9-401, to
incorporate Section 403 of the International Building Code (IBC), which is
current and more consistent with national codes.

Section 403 of the IBC includes guidance on the construction of high rise
buildings, including fire-resistance rating, seismic considerations, structural
integrity of exit enclosures and elevator hoistway enclosures, sprinkler systems,
and emergency systems.

The Department of Housing and Community Development encourages the
passage of City Council Bill 17-0033.

MB:sd

cc: Ms, Karen Stokes, Mayor's Office of Government Relations D E @ E |] W] IE
Mr. Kyron Banks, Mayor 's Office of Government Relations !

{  MAR 27 2017

< BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL

PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

437 East Fayette Street - Balamore, MD 21202 + MD Relay 711 « TTY 410 547 9247 - BaltimorcHousing. org
Hakimore Howine nflec the combined cffasts of thie Howing Authority of Naltimere Citv and the Bakdmore Citv Desarement of Houkne and Communey Develonment.



.-
-




14

15

16

17
18

19

20

2]
22

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CounciL BiLL 17-0033
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: March 20, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development

A BILL ENTITLED
AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building Code - Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”
FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by

the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part II. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, delctions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction
Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law.
(Brackets] indicate matter delcted from existing law.

dirl7-D045(2)~ st/ 1 6Marl?
BFR/ch17-DD33=1sla3:nbr



10
11

12
i3

Council Bill 17-0033
202.2.35 [High-rise building. *High-rise building” has the meaning stated in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.] {VACANT}
Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Ocecupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.]

[Exception: {Not Adopted})
[403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {As in IBC}
SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
arc not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior

Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30™ day
after the date it is enacted.

dirl7-0145(2}-15t/16Marl? 2
BFR/ch]7-0033~ 13032 nie * =



APPROVED FOR FORM '
|
i

INTRODUCTORY* STYLE, AND TE¥TUAL SUFFIENCY
I
|

CITY OF BALTIMORE ; 3’[ W
COUNCIL BILL / 7~ 503 = [l_perrLecisig o

e — e E
= {E-1 1
—lele— ——— e

Introduced by: The Council President
At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)

A BILL ENTITLED
7.z

AN ORDINANCE concerning -
La v
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building” H 0@

FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of “high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by
the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 to 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CiTY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part 1I. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction
Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

202.2.35 [High-rise building. “High-rise building” has the meaning stated in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.] {VACANT}

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate motter added 1o existing law.
[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.

* WARNING: THIS IS AN UNOFFICIAL, INTRODUCTORY COPY OF THE BILL.
THE OFFICIAL COPY CONSIDERED BY THE CITY COUNCIL IS THE FIRST READER COPY.

dirl 7-145(2)~ntro/| SMarl 7
BFR/High-RiseBldgs/aa me



Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.]

[Exception: {Not Adopted}]
[403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {As in IBC}
SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior

Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day
after the date it is enacted.

difl 7-145¢2)-intra/1 Shar1 7 2
DFR/High-RiseBidgs/name e



P PN |

D oc ~1 O Ln

11

12

13

14

15

16
17

18

19

20
21

CITY OF BALTIMORE
ORDINANCE
Council Bill 17-0033

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: March 20, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

Committee Report: Favorable
Council action: Adopted
Read second time: April 24, 2017

AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING
Building Code — Correcting Definition of “High-Rise Building”

FOR the purpose of deleting from the City Building Code an outdated definition of *high-rise
building”, thereby conforming that term’s meaning to the more modern definition adopted by
the International Building Code.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes

Section 2-103 (BC § 202.2.35 and §§ 403.1 t0 403.4.)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the

Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:
Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part II. International Building Code
§ 2-103. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

Chapter 2. Definitions; Rules of Construction

Section 202 Definitions

202.2 Supplemental definitions. Notwithstanding any different definition in the
International Building Code, the following terms have the meanings given in this § 202.2.

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law.
[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.
Undeslining indicates matter added to the bill by amendment.
Strikecont indicates matter stricken from the bill by

amendment or deleted from existing law by amendment.

dirl 7-0145{2)-3rd O6Ap:L7
BFR/cb17-0033-3rdza:nbe



9
10
1]

12
i3

Council Bill 17-0033

202.2.35 [High-rise building. “High-rise building” has the meaning stated in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.] {VACANT}

Chapter 4. Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy
Section 403 High-Rise Buildings

[403.1 Applicability. This § 403 applies to all “high-rise buildings”, as defined in State
Public Safety Article § 9-401.]

[Exception: {Not Adopted}]

[403.2] 403.1 to 403.4 {As in IBC}

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day

after the date it i1s enacted.

Certified as duly passed this day of 2 20

~ President, Baltimore City Council

Certified as duly delivered to Her Honor, the Mayor,

this day of >2() .

" ChiefClerk

Approved this day of , 20

Mayor, Baltimore City

dled 7-0145{2}-Ird/06Apr1 T 2
BFR/chI T-£8033-Ird/3a:nbr b o



