Introduced by: The Council President
At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)

Prepared by: Department of Legislative Reference Date: February 1, 2017
Referred to: JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATION® commitee

Also referred for recommendation and report to municipal agencies listed on reverse.

ity CounciL | 7-_©0I7

A BILL ENTITLED

AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

" FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

LY a Y'Y ]

**The introduction of an Ordinance or Resolution by Councilmembers at the

request of any person, firm or organization is a courtesy exte
- nd
Councilmembers and not an Indication of their posiﬂony SrRvile

1050-14- 1 AEV. 1043



11110

o T

YO

Qg T

ST s

WO|SSIuIo;) ddeAp

uoissiuo?) Suluue]d

pigag Apdoyny dujied

JIU0ISSTUIWOD) 10q8T]
1LI)SAS JudwWaINY SIakojduryg 3dnjog » 2114

pivog [0J3U0)) [BJUIWUCIALTY

PO
wayskg 1uau;a.|nau Saake|dwsy

AN[IGBUIBISNS UO UOISSILIWIO))

UONBAIISIL ] |BIN)INIYILY PUB |BIII0ISIH 10§ ‘LU0

sjeaddy Buiuoz pue (ediqyungy jo pascg
s3t3g jo pleog

saBurysy Jo pleog

SUOISSIIITO,) PUE SPIEOg

L))

jusunaedaq adjoq

10AB A 3] JO 2301JO

£3ojouyda | uonrWLIOJU] JO 3O S, 0KBIA

$3D1AI3G UBWINY JO 321IFO S JOABTA

juawdopraaq wawdopdwy jo 201330 5, 1048 ]\
wawsedaq yeay —
yuaupaedaq atig

uonjepiodsuel | fo mamuada'g’q

SHABJ PUE UOIIBAIIIY Jo Juawtedacy

a)mysq |83y Jo yuaunaedag

SHIOM dHignd JO wammdau/_

sapuady

LT

10

21330

RELE10 ]
Sumnrueld jo juaunisdag

$32.1n053} uBWINK jJo mamuuda(]

yusmdoppaag Apunwuiwoeyy pue Suisnoy jo Juaupaedaq 71

$32[AIRG [BJIUIS) o yuauwrjaedagy
adxueulq jo juamyredaqg ™
supny jo juawuedaq —
YO s Jonydueoy —
1032108 A1 _7
uonetodio) yjuamdoraaq aiownjeyg

urajsAS (00438 d1[qRg AND sownjeg



L B

D oo ~) v Ln

10

12
13
14

15
16

17

18

19

20

21
22

CITY OF BALTIMOB®™ 0 8
ORDINANCE_ | § VOV
Council Bill 17-0017

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: February 6, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

Committee Report: Favorable

Council action: Adopted

Read second time: February 27, 2017

AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VIII. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as

follows:
EXPLANATION: CAFITALS indicate matter added to existin

[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law. M A '-f 1 9 20‘”

Underlining indicates matter added to the bill by amendibst. o

Strike-ont indicates matter stricken from the bill by
amendment or deleted from existing law by amendmdnt.

TIMORE CITY COUNCIL |
| *PRESiDENTS OFFICE |

die) 201 13-3rd22Feb17
BFR/eb17-0017=3rd/an:nbr



Council Bili 17-0017

1 Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems

2 [Sections 605 to 608 fAs in IFC}}

3 SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS

4 605.1 T0 605.10 {AS INIFC}

3 605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {AS INIF(C}

6 605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. {ASINIFC}

i 605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {ASINIFC}

8 605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
9 photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Sections]
10 §§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.
11 EXCEPTION: [Thesc requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
12 constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
13 {NoT ADOPTED}
14 605.11.1.2.1 T0 605.1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
i5 605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS. {ASINIFC}
16 605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. {4S INIFC}

17 SECTIONS 606 TO 608 {ASINIFC}

18 CoMMENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
19 § 605.11 {“Solar photovoltaic power systems”}. Both of these sections have been

20 incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City’s BFR Codes, including the
21 current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other
22 things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC,

23 Presumably, it did this in reliance on — and to avoid undue redundancy with — the like

24 requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unforiunately, the persons responsible
25 for this “Errata” seem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1,2, which (as
26 shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic

27 systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and constructed
28 in accordance with the International Restdential Code”. This correction repeals that

29 exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections - for
30 all Group R-3 buildings, including those structures governed by the IRC.

31 Part X. International Residential Code

32 §10-102. City modifications.

33

34 The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
35 follows:

AN 7-011-Inb22Fehl? 2
BFR/cb17-00 7-3rd/sa:nbr = =



Lh Ja L)

O O 00 -] N

11

13

14

5
16
17

18

19
20

21

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33

34
35
36

37
38

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 3. Building Planning
SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC' WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC,

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

1. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4° SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER AFPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURB, OR

2. AGROSS ANY ADJOINING PROPERTY.

COMMENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf, e.g., RC § 404.6 {“Underpinning”};
RC § 210.1 {*Rooftop ... Structures”}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112{“Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces"},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTFION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day
after the date it is enacted.

dir) 7-01 13-3rd22Febl 7 3
BFR/cb17-0017-3nd/aa:nbr e



Council Bill 17-0017

Certified as duly passed this _ day ofMAR 0 6

President,

Certified as duly delivered to Her Honor, the Mayor,

this  dayof __MAR_O_B_ZQH_

S Chief Clerk

Approved this [ 7 dayof Movce b 20 177

Mayor, Baltimore City #

Fpprovgkd Er. Form and Legal Sufficiency =
L — St ch—Q 01 T
This Day of _—}¥ip1C N

__Mye—dio

Assistant Solicitor -

dic17-00113-3rd22Fcbl 7 4
BFR/ch] 7-001 7-3nd/aa:nbe g



-

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS COMMITTEE
VOTING RECORD

BILL#:  CC-17-0017 DATE: L-dl-[7

BILL TITLE: Building, Fire, And Related Codes —
International Residential Code - Corrections

MOTION BY: __ S(OTT SECONDED BY: (| ARKE

X] FAVORABLE [ ] FAVORABLE WITH AMENDMENTS
[ ] UNFAVORABLE [ ] WITHOUT RECOMMENDATION
NAME YEAS NAYS ABSENT | ABSTAIN
Costello, E., Chair E g g L
Clarke, M., Vice Chair @ g g Q
Bullock, J. @ g g ;l
Pinkett, L. id L] [ [
Reisinger, E. g g E g
Scott, B. @ g g g
Stokes, R. ) [ ]
2 L L L [
2 L] L Ll L]
& [ L] [] L]
E | ] L] L] o
* L] L] L L
: L L L L]
2 L [ L L]
2 U [ L] L
2 L] L] L L]
g L L L o
: L] 5] H Ll
0 [ [ | [ [

%
lﬁmw ¢ 1 o T 1 017
CHAIRPERSON:_X = T A

COMMITTEE STAFF: D'Paul 8. Nibber, Initials: ___ D7)







HEARING NOTES

Bill: 17-0017

Building, Fire, And Related Codes - International Residential Code - Corrections

Committee: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations
Chaired By: Councilmember Eric Costello

Hearing Date: February 21, 2017

Time (Beginning): 10:20 a.m.

Time (Ending): 10:30 a.m.

Location: Clarence "Du" Burns Chamber
Total Attendance: ~20

Committee Members in Attendance:

Mary Pat Clarke John Bullock Brandon Scott
Leon Pinkett Robert Stokes Eric Costello

Bill Synopsis in the file? ...... yes [Ino [Insa
Attendance sheet in the file? MXyes [Inoe [In/a
Agency reports read? .....c.crseesessssssssassssasses MXyes [(Jno [Jw/a
Hearing televised or audio-digitally recorded? v Jyes XIno [Jn/a
Certification of advertising/posting notices in the file?........ccceerrecerrueee [lyes [no n/a
Evidence of notification to property owners? [lyes [Ino X n/a
Final vote taken at this hearing? ...... yes [ Ilno [In/a
Motioned bBY: ....cccvecisssnrnsressnsnsssssasnsnsns Councilmember Scott
Seconded By:...uvemesernennnsns Councilmember Clarke
Final Vote: Favorable

Major Speakers
(This is not an attendance record.)
e Ms. Sharon Duboin, Housing and Community Development
e Mr. Franc Udenta, Housing and Community Development






Major Issues Discussed

1. Chairman Costello introduced the proceedings and asked the agencies in attendance whether
they stand by their reports. Each agency reported in the affirmative.

2. Ms. Sharon Duboin discussed the purpose of the Bill. She stated that the building code must
be updated from time to time according to international standards. Ms. Duboin added that the
current revision creates two changes affecting solar panels and certain rights-of-way.

3. Councilwoman Clarke asked what the meaning of photovoltaic systems is, and was told that it
is a reference to solar panels. She then asked what the specific regulation would be as it pertains to
solar panels. Mr. Franc Udenta informed the Councilwoman that it relates to fire safety, and
requires a three foot right-of-way along two edges of a given roof for first responders.

4. Councilman Scott asked whether non-paved alleys, or "paper alleys," would be included in the
regulations governing drainage. Mr. Udenta informed him that they likely would be because they
are an area into which water drains and they are a "right-of-way" as described in the Bill.

Further Study
Was further study requested? |:| Yes & No
If yes, describe.
Committee Vote:
E. COSLEII0: coeveeeresensenseressassessescesasascossasorsnssssesssssnsssorsasssnsnss Yea
M. Clarke: Yea
J. BULLOCK: teetserrerrrerersrenssnssrrnssrssesssnsssssessassaosssesssssnssrssssussasssnasssesssasssnaasenaassass Yea
L. Pinkett: .. Yea
E. Reisinger: Absent
B SCOLS crveeicrcrrssnrncesssensesssrrsssssssansesessssensessrensossorssssssssssnansrassassesssanssassssanassosss Yea
R. Stokes: . Yea
D'Paul Nibber, Committee Staff Date: February 22,2017
cc: Bill File
OCS Chrono File
Hearing Notes

Page 2 of 2






CIiTY OF BALTIMO
C1TY COUNCIL HEARING ATTEN

Committee: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations

Date: February 21, 2017 | Time: 10:05AM _ | Place:

m:rhmnﬁ Ordinance - Building, Fire, And Related Codes - International Residential C:

PLEASE PRINT

I1F YOU WANT TO TESTIFY PLEASE

FIRST NAME LLAST NAME ST.# | ADDRESS/ORGANIZATION NAME
John Doe 100 North Charles Street 21
§ HQ V.:\NN \.wu\;ﬂ n¥§ N&“?\ \.lmsmkuh\ 2
SN e Oafqb\f( B n\mL.
L UAentz YISYE
\Jﬂoﬂﬂ V4 Huomine gye)

Keistan | 0ldzapet DPw







BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS
COMMITTEE

Mission Statement

On behalf of the Citizens of Baltimore City, the mission of the Judiciary and
Legislative Investigations Committee is to investigate and study the continuing
operations, efficiency, and functions of Baltimore City government in accordance
with the laws of Baltimore City, the State of Maryland, and the United States.

As a result of its investigations and studies, the Committee will recommend and

oversee reforms to improve the operations of Baltimore City's government through
legislative, administrative, and/or budgetary processes.

The Honorable Eric T. Costello
Chairman

PUBLIC HEARING

Tuesday, February 21, 2017
10:05 AM
CLARENCE "DU" BURNS COUNCIL CHAMBERS

Council Bill 17-0017
Building, Fire, and Related Codes -
International Residential Code - Corrections




CITY COUNCIL COMMITTEES

BUDGET AND APPROPRIATIONS
Eric Costello — Chair

Leon Pinkett — Vice Chair
Bill Henry
Sharon Green Middleton
Brandonr M. Scott
Isaac *Yitzy" Schleifer
Shannon Sneed

Staff: Marguerite Murray

EDUCATION AND YOUTH
Zeke Cohen — Chair
Mary Pat Clarke = Vice Chair
John Bullock
Kristerfer Burnett
Ryan Dorsey

Staff: D'Paul Nibber

EXECUTIVE APPOINTMENTS
Robert Stokes — Chair
Kristerfer Burnett— Vice Chair
Mary Pat Clarke
Zeke Cohen
Isaac “Yitzy" Schleifer

Staff: Jennifer Coales

HOUSING AND URBAN AFFAIRS
John Bullock — Chair
Isaac “Yitzy” Schleifer — Vice Chair
Kristerfer Burnett
Bill Henry
Shannon Sneed
Zeke Cohen
Ryan Dorsey
Staff: Richard Krummerich

JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE INVESTIGATIONS
Eric Costello = Chair
Mary Pat Clarke — Vice Chair
John Bullock
Leon Pinkett
Ed Reisinger
Brandon Scott
Robert Stokes
Staff: D'Paul Nibber

Rev. 1/3/17

LA
Shannon Sneed — Chair
Robert Stokes — Vice Chair
Eric Costello
Bill Henry
Mary Pat Clarke

Staff: Marguerite Murray

LAND USE AND TRANSPORTATION
Edward Reisinger - Chair
Sharon Green Middleton - Vice Chair
Mary Pat Clarke
Eric Costello
Ryan Dorsey
Leon Pinkett
Raobert Stokes
Staff: Marshall Bell

PUBLIC SAFETY

Brandon Scott — Chair

Ryan Dorsey = Vice Chair

Kristerfer Burnett

Shannon Sneed

Zeke Cohen

Leon Pinkett

{saac "Yitzy” Schleifer
Staff: Marshall Bell

TAXATION, FINANCE AND ECONOMIC
DEVELOPMENT
Sharon Green Middleton — Chair
Leon Pinkett — Vice Chair
Erick Costello
Edward Reisinger
Robert Stokes
Staff: Jennifer Coales
- Larry Greene (pension only)




BILL SYNOPSIS

Committee: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations

Bill 17-0017

Building, Fire, And Related Codes - International Residential Code - Corrections

Sponsor: President Young, et al
Introduced: February 6, 2017

Purpose:

For the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems
for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain
regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

Effective: 30" day after the date it is enacted

Hearing Date/Time/Location: February 21, 2017/10:05 a.m./Clarence "Du" Burns Chamber

Agency Reports

Department of Law Favorable
Department of Housing and Community Development Favorable
Department of Transportation Favorable

Department of Public Works Favorable



#

ANALYSIS

Current Law
Council Bill 17-0017 amends the current building code, specifically City Code, Building, Fire,
and Related Codes, § 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2).

Background

Council Bill 17-0017 revises the City's International Fire Code and International Residential
Code with respect to solar photovoltaic systems, better known as solar energy panels.
Specifically, it adopts new changes to the International Residential Code by the International
Code Council, and repeals an unintentional exception for Group R-3 buildings regarding
regulations that govern the use of solar panels. The Bill also amends the International
Residential Code to improve consistency between the regulations concerning the driveways,
paved surfaces, parking areas, and/or surface drainage of one- and two- family dwellings, and
other residential units.

The Department of Law has approved the Bill for form and sufficiency. The Department of
Housing and Community Development and the Department of Public Works offered favorable
reports for 17-0014. The Department of Transportation also offered a favorable report, and
noted that the language of the bill "clarifies the need for a permit from [DOT} when creating a
driveway entrance on a public right-of-way."

Bill Synopsis 17-0017
Page 2 of 3



Additional Information

Fiscal Note: Not Available

information Source(s): Department of Housing and Community Development; Department of
Law; Department of Transportation; Department of Public Works

PPl 3 Nlen,
Analysis by: D'Paul S. Nibber Direct Inquiries to: (410) 396-1268
Analysis Date: February 17, 2017

Bill Synopsis 17-0017
Page 3 of 3



]

LIF N S PV ]

18

19

20

21

22
23

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CouNncIL BiLL 17-0017
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: February 6, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development, Department of Transportation, Department of Public Works

A BILL ENTITLED
AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code - Corrections

FOR the purposc of cxpressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VII1. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter edded to existing law.
|Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.

dlr§ 7-0]13-15t02Febl ?
BFR/ck) 7-001 7~ 1stfancohe



Council Bill 17-0017

1 Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems

~

[Sections 605 to 608 {As in IFC}]

3 SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS

4 605.1 TO 605.10 {ASINIFC}
5 605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {AS INIFC}
6 605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. /ASINIFC}
7 605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {ASINIFC}
8 605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
9 photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Sections]
10 §§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.
11 EXCEPTION: [Thesc requircments shall not apply to structures designed and
12 constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
13 {NOT ADOPTED}
14 605.11.1.2.1 TO 605.1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
i5 605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS. {ASINIFC}
16 605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. {4SINIFC}

17 SECTIONS 606 TO 608 {ASINIFC}

18 CoMMENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
1% § 605.11 {*“Solar photovoltaic power systems™}. Both of these sections have been

20 incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City's BFR Codes, including the
21 current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other
22 things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC's 2015 Edition of the IRC.

23 Presumably, it did this in reliance on — and to avoid undue redundancy with — the like

24 requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unfortunately, the persons responsible
25 for this “Errata™ seem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1.2, which (as
26 shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic

27 systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and constructed
28 in accordance with the International Residential Code™. This correction repeals that

29 exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections — for
30 all Group R-3 buildings, including those structures govemned by the IRC.

31 Part X. International Residential Code

32 § 10-102. City modifications.

33

34 The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City arc as
35 follows:

dle) 7-01 13- st02Feb] 7 2
BFR/cbl7-001 7~1st/ua:nbr T %



th 5 W

OO0~

15
16
17

18

19
20

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
3l
32
33

34
35
36

37
38

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 3. Building Planning
SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITII TIIE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING, PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH TIE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC.

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYCOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITIL:

1. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURE, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADJOINING PROPERTY.

COMMENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. (Y., e.g., RC § 404.6 {*Underpinning™};
RC § 910.1 {“Roofiop ... Structures™}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112{“Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces”},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlincs containcd in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30™ day
after the datc it is enacted.

dlr17-0113~1302Febl 7 3
BFR/cbI7-0017-1st/anplx - -



JUDICIARY AND LEGISLATIVE
INVESTIGATIONS COMMITTEE

Council Bill 17-0017

Hearing Date: February 21, 2017

Agency Reports:

Department of Law
o Favorable

Department of Housing and Community Development
o Favorable

Department of Transportation

o Favorable

Department of Public Works
o Favorable




DEPARTMENT OF LAW

101 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CATHERINE E PUGH, Mayor

February 16, 2017

The Honorab!e President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Atin: Natawna B. Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hall
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re: City Council Bill 17-0017 - Building, Fire, and Related Codes -
International Residential Code — Corrections

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0017 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill expressly continues the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings and reinstates the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

Sincgrely,

L [ s

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

ce:  David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations
Angela Gibson, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division
Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor
Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor




P “""u%

/ 5
140
Y

BALTIMORE
HOUSING

CATHERINE PUGH

Mayor

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN

Actimg Executive Direcior, HABC

Acting Commissioner, HCD

q& wEIVE
L} FEG 13 2017

BAL'ﬂMOHE CITY COUNCIL

L{EM ORAND-U-M PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

To:  The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

From: Michael Braverman, Acting Commissioner @
Date: February 8, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0017 — Building, Fire, And Related Codes —
international Residential Code - Corrections

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation
of solar photovoltaic power systems for all I- and 2-family dwellings; and
expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations govemning driveways
and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

If enacted, this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the
Building, Fire and Related Codes (BFR). The first change would be to
accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council (ICC) govemning
solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code.
The second change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the
development of parking lots, driveway and other paved surfaces.

The current version of the City’s BFR Codes incorporates, by reference, the
requirements of the International Residential Codes (ICC) §324.7 for Solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among
other things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7 in its entirely, except for a section that refers
to Group R-3 buildings, which states, “These requirements shall not apply to
structures designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC”. The deletion
was to avoid redundancy with like requirements in IFC § 605.11.1.2 but the
failure to remove the language pertaining to R-3 building inadvertently removed
the requirements of IRC from pertaining to Group R-3 Buildings. The proposed
legislation repeals that language, thereby continuing the requirements — and their
consequent protections — for all Group R-3 building, including those structures
governed by the IRC.

The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC, but applicable

?

T AL
417 East Fayette Street + Baldmore, MD 21202 - MD Relay 711 - TTY 410 547 9247 - BaltimoreHousing.org

Halei Houcing

the enmt

vl offorees of the H Arshoriry of Ralrimners Ciev and she Flabi Clire I ~f Henwinwe snd C v Plevel




to 1 — and 2-family dwellings were amended into the BFR codes. Recently, it was
discovered that the local building codes provisions for Parking Lots, Driveways,
and Other Paved Surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings, was
mistakenly omitted. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the appropriate sections of the BFR
codes.

The Department of Housing and Community Development encourages the
passage of City Council Biil 17-0017.

MB:sd

cc: Ms. Karen Stokes, Mayor's Office of Government Relations
Mr. Kyron Banks, Mayor s Office of Government Relations



NAME & TITLE Frank J. Murphy, Acting Director CITY of
AGENCY NAME & Department of Transportation (DOT)
ADDRESS 417 East Fayette Street, Room 527 1o H0L 0152
SUBIECT City Council Bill 17-0017 MEMO
TO  The Honorable President and February 16, 2017
Members of the City Council
c/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 City Hall

I am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of
solar photovoltaic power systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of
certain regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

As drafted this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related
Codes (BFR). The first change would be to accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council
(1CC) governing solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code. The second

change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the development of parking lots, driveway and other
paved surfaces.

Recently, it was discovered that the local building codes provisions for Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other
Paved Surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings, was mistakenly omitted. This bill corrects that
oversight by expressly incorporating those relevant portions into the appropriate sections of the BFR codes.
The new language clarifies the need for a permit from the Department of Transportation (DOT) when creating
a driveway entrance on a public right-of-way.

DOT supports this bill.

Thank you for this opportunity to comment.

Respectfully,

Acting Director
FIM/PAF

Cc:  Karen Stokes, Mayor’s Office
Kyron Banks, Mayor's Office






NAME &
TITLE

e w———

Rudolph S. Chow, P.E., Director CITY of

AGENCY
NAME &
ADDRESS

Department of Public Works BALTIMORE

EROM

SUBJECT

600 Abel Wolman Municipal Building
MEMO

CITY COUNCIL BILL 17-0017

10

DATE: February 13, 2017
The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
¢/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 - City Hall

I am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 introduced by the Council President at the
request of the Administration (DHCD).

The purpose of this Bill is to expressly continue the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain
regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

The City's 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related Codes (BFR) is in part comprised of
the International Building Code (IBC), International Fire Code (IFC), and Intemnational
Residential Code (IRC), among various other International Codes published by the International
Code Council (ICC). City Council Bill 17-0017, if adopted, would amend two sections of the
City's BFR Codes.

The first proposed change would accommodate recent changes made by the ICC to the IRC on
solar photovaltaic power systems. The current version of the City’s Code incorporates both the
IRC § 324.7 and the IFC § 605.11, which each describe the same requirements for solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other things,
“deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC's 2015 Edition of the IRC, in order to avoid
the redundancy with the IFC. However, the change did not repeal the language that exempts
Group R-3 buildings that are designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC, thereby
inadvertently removing the requirement for R-3 buildings to abide to the IFC. City Council Bill
17-0017 would repeal the exception language, ensuring that the requirements of the IFC
regarding photovoltaic power systems also apply to all Group R-3 buildings.

Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC but applicable to 1- and 2-
family dwellings are included in the City’s BFR Codes. The second change proposed by City
Council Bill 17-0017 would correct an oversight that had omitted the Jocal building code
provisions for parking lots, driveways, and other paved surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family
dwellings. The legislation would expressly incorporate those relevant portions regarding
driveway entrances, surface paving, parking areas, and surface drainage into the BFR Codes.

Based on these findings, the Department of Public Works supports the passage of City Council
Bill 17-0017.

E @ E " M E Sincerely,

RE CITY COUNGIL
PRES)
RCSRTO S-S OFFICE







NAME & TITLE Frank J. Murphy, Acting Director CITY of
AGENCY NAME & Department of Transportation (DOT)

ADDRESS 417 East Fayette Street, Room 527 B Rh 01
SUBJECT City Council Bill 17-0017 MEMO
TO  The Honorable President and February 16, 2017
Members of the City Council
c/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 City Hall

I am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of
solar photovoltaic power systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of
certain regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

As drafted this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related
Codes (BFR). The first change would be to accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council
(1CC) govemning solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code. The second

change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the development of parking lots, driveway and other
paved surfaces.

Recently, it was discovered that the local building codes provisions for Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other
Paved Surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings, was mistakenly omitted. This bil! corrects that
oversight by expressly incorporating those relevant portions into the appropriate sections of the BFR codes.
The new language clarifies the need for a permit from the Department of Transportation (DOT) when creating

a driveway entrance on a public right-of-way.
DOT supports this bill.

Thank you for this opportunity to comment.
Respectfully,

B ol

Murphy
Acting Director

FIM/PAF

Cc:  Karen Stokes, Mayor’s Office
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Office







NAME &

TTLE | Rudolph S. Chow, P.E., Director S
| A5y Department of Public Works 1=V s vn. iaced s A

aooress| 600 Abel Wolman Municipal Building

MEMO

M susJECT

CITY COUNCIL BILL 17-0017

TO DATE:  February 13, 2017
The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
c/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 — City Hall

I am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 introduced by the Council President at the
request of the Administration (DHCD).

The purpose of this Bill is to expressly continue the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for al!l 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain
regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

The City’s 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related Codes (BFR) is in part comprised of
the International Building Code (IBC), International Fire Code (IFC), and International
Residential Code (IRC), among various other International Codes published by the International
Code Council (ICC). City Council Bill 17-0017, if adopted, would amend two sections of the
City’s BFR Codes.

The first proposed change would accommodate recent changes made by the ICC to the IRC on
solar photovoltaic power systems. The current version of the City’s Code incorporates both the
IRC § 324.7 and the IFC § 605.11, which each describe the same requirements for solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other things,
“deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the [CC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC, in order to avoid
the redundancy with the IFC. However, the change did not repeal the language that exempts
Group R-3 buildings that are designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC, thereby
inadvertently removing the requirement for R-3 buildings to abide to the IFC. City Council Bill
17-0017 would repeal the exception language, ensuring that the requirements of the IFC
regarding photovoltaic power systems also apply to all Group R-3 buildings.

Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC but applicable to 1- and 2-
family dwellings are included in the City’s BFR Codes. The second change proposed by City
Council Bill 17-0017 would correct an oversight that had omitted the local building code
provisions for parking lots, driveways, and other paved surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family
dwellings. The legislation would expressly incorporate those relevant portions regarding
driveway entrances, surface paving, parking areas, and surface drainage into the BFR Codes.

Based on these findings, the Department of Public Works supports the passage of City Council
Bill 17-0017.

D | E @ E ﬂ M E Sincerely,

S. Chow, P.E.

|

Director

BACTIMORE GITV GOl
NCIL

L PRESIDENT-

RCSKTOSRELS OFFICE

28-1418-5017

1400-10-53






DEPARTMENT OF LAW

161 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE

CATHERINE E. PUGH, Mayor

February 16, 2017

The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Attn: Natawna B, Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hall
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re: City Council Bill 17-0017 - Building, Fire, and Related Codes -
International Residential Code — Corrections

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0017 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill expressly continues the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings and reinstates the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

Sincetely,

AW, 0

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

cc: David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations
Angela Gibson, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division
Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor
Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL

| PRESIDENT'S OFTICE

@ Priated on recycled paper with environmentally friendly soy based ink.






BALTIMORE
HOUSING

CATHERINE PUGH
Mayor

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN

Acting Execntive Directar, HABC

Acang Commissioner, HCD

ED {li o EIVE
l{.. :

UL FEB 13 2017

N

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL

MEMORANDUM PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

To:  The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

From: Michael Braverman, Acting Commissioner Q(ao
Date: February 8, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0017 — Building, Fire, And Related Codes —
international Residential Code - Corrections

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation
of solar photovoltaic power systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and
expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations governing driveways
and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

If enacted, this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the
Building, Fire and Related Codes {(BFR). The first change would be to
accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council (ICC) governing
solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code.
The second change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the
development of parking lots, driveway and other paved surfaces.

The current version of the City’s BFR Codes incorporates, by reference, the
requirements of the International Residential Codes (ICC) §324.7 for Solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among
other things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7 in its entirely, except for a section that refers
to Group R-3 buildings, which states, “These requirements shall not apply to
structures designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC”. The deletion
was to avoid redundancy with like requirements in IFC § 605.11.1.2 but the
failure to remove the language pertaining to R-3 building inadvertently removed
the requirements of IRC from pertaining to Group R-3 Buildings. The proposed
legislation repeals that language, thereby continuing the requirements — and their
consequent protections — for all Group R-3 building, including those structures
governed by the IRC.

The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC, but applicable

N

k1
\

FRRE

417 East Fayette Street * Baltimore, MD 21202 « MD Relay 711 « TTY 410 547 9247 * BaltimoreHousing.org

Baltimore Housing reflects the combined efforts of the Housine Authority of Baltimore Gitv and the Baltimore Citv Department of Howsing and Communitv Development.



o it ity . e -




to 1 — and 2-family dwellings were amended into the BFR codes. Recently, it was
discovered that the local building codes provisions for Parking Lots, Driveways,
and Other Paved Surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings, was
mistakenly omitted. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the appropriate sections of the BFR
codes.

The Department of Housing and Community Development encourages the
passage of City Council Bill 17-0017.

MB:sd

cc: Ms. Karen Stokes, Mayor s Office of Government Relations
Mr. Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations






LV, I S S

= B2 SRR I &

il

12
13
14
15

16
17

18

19

20

21

22
23

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CounciL BiLL 17-0017
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: February 6, 2017

Assigned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development, Department of Transportation, Department of Public Works

A BILL ENTITLED

AN ORDINANCE concemning
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments
Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)

Baltimore City Revised Code
(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the

_Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VIII. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law,
[Brackets) indicate matter deleted from existing law,

dirl 701 1 3-150/02F bl 7
BFR/cHIT-0017=1sVaa nbr



11
12
13

15

16

17

18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

31

32
33
34
35

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems
[Sections 605 to 608 fAs in IFC}]
SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS
605.1 T0605.10 {ASINIFC}
605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. A4S INIFC}
605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. (ASINIFC}
605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {AS INIFC}

605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar

photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Scctions]
§8§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.

EXCEPTION: [These requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
{NOT ADOPTED}

605.11.1.2,1 T0 605,1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS. fASINIFC}
605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. {ASINIFC)}

SECTIONS 606 TO 608 (A4S INIFC}

ComnENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
§ 605.11 {“Solar photovoltaic power systems”}. Both of these sections have been
incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City's BFR Codes, including the
current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other
things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the 1CC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC.
Presumably, it did this in reliance on - and to avoid undue redundancy with -- the like
requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unfortunately, the persons responsible
for this “Errata™ seem Lo have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1.2, which (os
shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic
systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and constructed
in accordance with the International Residential Code™. This correction repeals that
exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections — for
all Group R-3 buildings, including those structures governed by the IRC.

Part X. International Residential Code
§ 10-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

At ) 7-0113-151702Fcbl? 2
BFR/cbI 70017~ svaa nbe - X



Lh

15
16
17

18

19
20

21

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33

34
35
36

37
38

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 3. Building Planning

SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC,

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

1. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURB, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADJOINING PROPERTY.

CommENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf., e.g., RC § 404.6 {“Underpinning”};
RC § 910.1 {“Rooftop ... Structures”}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112 {“Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces™},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance

are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day

after the date it is enacted.

dir} 701 13~15U02Feb) T 3
BFR/cb17-0017~1s3/aa:nbr = =






— ~- Hver )/ -

Catherine E. Pugh
Mayor

Room 250, City Hall
Baltimore, MD 21202

January 31, 2017

TO: Avery Aisenstark, Director, Department of Legislative Reference
FROM: Angela C. Gibson, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison to the City Councilaj@
SUBJECT: Bill Introduction for the Administration:

An Ordinance Concerning:

Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential
Code - Corrections

Please prepare the attached for introduction at the City Council meeting scheduled for Monday,
February 6, 2017 This bill is introduced at the request of the Administration (Department of Housing
and Community Development). Please return legislation to this office when completed.

If you have any questions regarding this legislation, please contact Sharon Daboin at 410.361.9015.
Thank you

ACG:sw

Attachment

cc: Peter Hammen, Chief of Operations
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations







APPROVED FNR T
INTRODUCTORY* ! STYLE, AND TEXTUAL i BIERCY
{ 2y
§ - -
CITY OF BALTIMORE [ PPN
CoUNCILBILL _ | oo s |

" e ———

Introduced by: The Council President
At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)

A BILL ENTITLED
AN ORDINANCE concerning
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
goveming driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

By adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VIII. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matier added 1o existing law.
{Brackets] indicate matter deleted from cxisting Eaw,

* WARNING: THIS IS AN UNOFFICIAL, INTRODUCTORY COPY OF TIE BILL.
THE OFFICIAL COI'Y CONSIDERED BY THE CITY COUNCIL IS THE FIRST READER COPY.

dirl 7-6113 -miro 01 Fetl 7
LFRIRC aame



Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems
[Sections 605 to 608 fAs in IFC}]
SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS
605.1 TO 605.10 fASINIFC}
605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {ASIN IFC}
605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. {ASINIFC}
605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {AS INIFC}

605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Sections]
§§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.

EXCEPTION: [These requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
{NOT ADOPTED}

605.11.1.2.1 70 605.1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PIIOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS, {ASINIFC}
605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. fASINIFC}
SECTIONS 600 TO 608 {ASIN[FC}

COMMENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
§ 605,11 {“Solar photovoltaic power systems™}. Both of these sections have been
incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City’s BFR Codes, including the
current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an “Errata™ that, among other
things, “deleted™ IRC § 324.7, in ils entirety, from the ICC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC.
Presumably, it did this in reliance on - and 10 avoid undue redundancy with -- the like
requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unfortunately, the persons responsible
{or this “Errata” seem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1.2, which (as
shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic
sysiems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and censtructed
in accordance with the Iniernational Residential Code”. This correction repeals that
exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections - for
all Group R-3 buildings, including those structures governed by the IRC.

Part X. International Residential Code

§ 10-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City arc as
follows:

de17-0113 o DIFehIT 2
BFRIRC 23 me - -



Chapter 3. Building Planning
SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC,

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

I. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURR, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADJOINING PROPERTY.

CommenT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City's BFR Codes.
Uniil then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings, In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf,, e.g., RC § 404.6 {“Underpinning”};
RC § 910.1 {“Rooftop ... Structures}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112{“Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces™},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to i- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30™ day
after the date it is enacted.

dlr17-0113~intco 01Fcb1? 3
BFRARCaa:me = -









ACTION BY THE CITY CTOUNCIL

FEB 06 2017

FIRST READING (INTRODUCTION)

PUBLIC HEARING HELD ON CEBRUARY 'y .l
COMMITTEE REPORT AS OF __ FERRUARY \1 20 11
X FAVORABLE UNFAVORABLE FAVORABLE AS AMENDED WITHOUT RECOMMENDATION
f N EO
Chair
COMMITTEE MEMBERS: COMMITTEE MEMBERS:

SECOND READING: The Council's action being favorable (unfavorabia), this City Council bilf wan {was not) ordered printed for

Third Reading om:
FEB 2 270 2017

——— Amendments were read and adopted (defeated) as Indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

THIRD READING MAR 0 QGZOW

——— Amendments were read and adopted (defeated) as indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

THIRD READING (ENROLLED) - 20
Amendments were read and adopted (defeated) as indicated on the copy attached to this blue backing.

THIRD READING (RE-ENROLLED) 20

WITHDRAWAL 20

There being no cbjections to the request for withdrawsl, it was so ordered that this City Council Ordinance be withdrawn
from the files of the City Caunc

(qu y\é M@@m,

President Chief Clerk




NAME & TITLE Frank J. Murphy, Acting Director CITY of
AGENCY NAME & Department of Transportation (DOT)
ADDRESS 417 East Fayetie Street, Room 527 S
SUBJECT City Council Bill 17-0017 MEMO
TO  The Honorable President and February 16, 2017
Members of the City Council
c/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 City Hall

1 am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of
solar photovoltaic power systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of
certain regulations goveming driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

As drafted this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related
Codes (BFR). The first change would be to accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council
(1CC) goveming solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code. The second
change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the development of parking lots, driveway and other
paved surfaces.

Recently, it was discovered that the focal building codes provisions for Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other
Paved Surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings, was mistakenly omitted. This bill corrects that
oversight by expressly incorporating those relevant portions into the appropriate sections of the BFR codes.
The new language clerifies the need for a permit from the Department of Transportation (DOT) when creating
a driveway entrance on a public right-of-way.

DOT supports this bill.
Thank you for this opportunity to comment.
Respectfully,

G Yoty

Frank J. Murphy
Acting Director

FIM/PAF

Cc:  Karen Stokes, Mayor's Office
Kyron Banks, Mayor's Office

F@EHME'

FEB 17

ATTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
BMﬁEESlDENT*s QFFICE







B NAME &
TITLE | Rudolph S. Chow, P.E., Director CITY of

| AGENCY | Department of Public Works BALTIMORE

7% | sooress| 600 Abel Wolman Municipal Building MEM O

8 SUBJECT

CITY COUNCIL BILL 17-0017

TO DATE:  February 13, 2017
The Honorable President and Members

of the Baltimore City Council
c/o Natawna Austin
Room 400 — City Hall

I am herein reporting on City Council Bill 17-0017 introduced by the Council President at the
request of the Administration (DHCD).

The purpose of this Bill is to expressly continue the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain
regulations governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

The City’s 2015 Edition of the Building, Fire and Related Codes (BFR) is in part comprised of
the International Building Code (IBC), International Fire Code (IFC), and International
Residential Code (IRC), among various other International Codes published by the International
Code Council (ICC). City Council Bill 17-0017, if adopted, would amend two sections of the
City’s BFR Codes.

The first proposed change would accommodate recent changes made by the ICC to the IRC on
solar photovoltaic power systems. The current version of the City’s Code incorporates both the
IRC § 324.7 and the IFC § 605.11, which each describe the same requirements for solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other things,
“deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC, in order to avoid
the redundancy with the IFC. However, the change did not repeal the language that exempts
Group R-3 buildings that are designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC, thereby
inadvertently removing the requirement for R-3 buildings to abide to the IFC. City Council Bill
17-0017 would repeal the exception language, ensuring that the requirements of the IFC
regarding photovoltaic power systems also apply to all Group R-3 buildings.

Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC but applicable to 1- and 2-
family dwellings are included in the City’s BFR Codes. The second change proposed by City
Council Bill 17-0017 would correct an oversight that had omitted the local building code
provisions for parking lots, driveways, and other paved surfaces, applicable to 1- and 2-family
dwellings. The legislation would expressly incorporate those relevant portions regarding
driveway entrances, surface paving, parking areas, and surface drainage into the BFR Codes.

Based on these findings, the Department of Public Works supports the passage of City Council
Bill 17-0017.

Sincerely,

)EGEHWE

; %\_)
FEI | 6 017 /S
Rugdolph)S. Chow, P.E.
Director
SALTIMORE CiTY COUNCIL
PRESIB&MI iICE
28-1418-5017

1400-10-53






DEPARTMENT OF LAW

101 City Hall
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CATHERINE E. PUGH, Mayor

February 16, 2017

The Honorable President and Members
of the Baltimore City Council
Attn: Natawna B. Austin, Executive Secretary
Room 409, City Hail
100 N. Holliday Street
Baltimore, Maryland 21202

Re: City Council Bill 17-0017 - Building, Fire, and Related Codes -
International Residential Code — Corrections

Dear President and City Council Members:

The Law Department has reviewed City Council Bill 17-0017 and approves it for form
and legal sufficiency. The bill expressly continues the regulation of solar photovoltaic power
systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings and reinstates the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all I- and 2-family dwellings.

Victor K. Tervala
Chief Solicitor

cc; David Ralph, Acting City Solicitor
Karen Stokes, Director, Mayor’s Office of Government Relations
Angela Gibson, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Kyron Banks, Mayor’s Legislative Liaison
Elena DiPietro, Chief Solicitor, General Counsel Division
Hilary Ruley, Chief Solicitor
Jennifer Landis, Assistant Solicitor

D;E@EHWE;D

| FER 16 2017 '|

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
PRESIDENT'S OFFICE |

%

@ Printed on recycled paper with environmentally friendly soy based ink.






BALTIMORE
HOUSING

CATHERINE PUGH
AMovor

MICHAEL BRAVERMAN
Acting Executtve Thrector, HABC
Acting Commussianer, HCI)

X

M)ECELVEN
I~ D
i.n. FEB 13 2017

BALTIMORE CITY COUNCIL
MEMORANDUM PRESIDENT'S OFFICE

To:  The Honorable President and Members of the Baltimore City Council
c/o Natawna Austin, Executive Secretary

From: Michael Braverman, Acting Commissioner @

Date: February 8, 2017

Re:  City Council Bill 17-0017 — Building, Fire, And Related Codes —
international Residential Code - Corrections

The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD) has reviewed
City Council Bill 17-0017 for the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation
of solar photovoltaic power systems for all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and
expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations governing driveways
and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

If enacted, this bill would modify two sections of the City’s 2015 Edition of the
Building, Fire and Related Codes (BFR). The first change would be to
accommodate recent changes to the International Code Council (ICC) governing
solar photovoltaic power systems that need to be incorporated into the local code.
The second change is to add provisions in the local code that guide the
development of parking lots, driveway and other paved surfaces.

The current version of the City’s BFR Codes incorporates, by reference, the
requirements of the International Residential Codes (1CC) §324.7 for Solar
photovoltaic power systems. Recently, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among
other things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7 in its entirely, except for a section that refers
to Group R-3 buildings, which states, “These requirements shall not apply to
structures designed and constructed in accordance with the IRC”. The deletion
was to avoid redundancy with like requirements in IFC § 605.11.1.2 but the
failure to remove the language pertaining to R-3 building inadvertently removed
the requirements of IRC from pertaining to Group R-3 Buildings. The proposed
legislation repeals that language, thereby continuing the requirements — and their

consequent protections — for all Group R-3 building, including those structures
governed by the IRC.

The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Various local building code provisions not addressed by the IRC, but applicable

417 East Fayette Street + Baltimore, MD 21202 * MD Relay 711 » TTY 410 547 9247 * BaltimoreHousing.org

Baltimore Housine reflects the combined cffors of e Houstne Awtherity of Daltiniore City and the Baltimore Citv Department of Mousing and Cor itv Devel




'S




n

18

19

20

21

22
23

CITY OF BALTIMORE
CouNciL BiLL 17-0017
(First Reader)

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: February 6, 2017

Assipgned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investigations Committee

REFERRED TO THE FOLLOWING AGENCIES: City Solicitor, Department of Housing and Community
Development, Department of Transportation, Department of Public Works

A BILL ENTITLED

AN ORDINANCE concerning

Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all - and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VII1. International Fire Code
§ 8-102, City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

ExrLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law
| Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.

die17-0113-181/02Fcbl?
BFR/cb17-0017~1st/aa:nte



]

18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

31

32
33
34
35

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems
[Sections 605 to 608 fAs in IFC}]
SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS
605.1 TO 605.10 {ASINIFC}
605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {ASINIFC}
605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. {ASINIFC}
605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. fASINIFC}

605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with {Scctions]
§§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.

EXCEPTION: [These requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
{NOT ADOPTED}

605.11.1.2.1 10 605.1.2.5 f{ASINIFC}
605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS, {AS INIFC}
605,12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. {ASINIFC}

SECTIONS 606 TO 608 /AS INIFC}

ComMENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
§ 605.11 {“Solar photovoltaic power systems”}. Both of these sections have been
incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City’s BFR Codes, including the
current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an *Errata” that, among other
things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the 1CC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC,
Presumably, it did this in reliance on — and to avoid undue redundancy with -- the like
requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unfortunately, the persons responsible
for this “Errata” seem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11,1.2, which (as
shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic
systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and construcied
in accordance with the International Residential Code™. This correction repeals that
exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections - for
all Group R-3 buildings, incliding those structures governed by the IRC.

Part X. International Residential Code
§ 10-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

dird 7-0113-1s1/02Fcb| 7 2
BFR/eb] 7-001 7- I staanbe o =



[FS] ]

v

oW o0 -1

—_—

11

13

14

15
16
17

18

19
20

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
3
32
33

34
35
36

37
38

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 3. Building Planning

SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITIH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH TIHE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC,

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

1. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURB, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADIOINING PROPERTY.

ConmnmENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those I- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf, e.g., RC § 404.6 {*Underpinning™};
RC § 910.1 {“Rooftop ... Structures”}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112 {*Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces"},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance

are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day

after the date it is enacted.

dirl7-01L3~181/02F b1 7 3
BFR/cb17-0017-1s'sanbr = -






APPROVED FOR Frurse
INTRODUCTORY* ! STYLE, AND TEXTUAL =4 FIENCY
H » E=
f s
CITY OF BALTIMORE P
COUNCILBILL | 7-0017 || peonicsums kewsmver_|

Introduced by: The Council President
At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)

AN ORDINANCE concerning — T
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Correctin:msH‘C

Do+

FoR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for no
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

A BILL ENTITLED

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)
Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

By adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VIIL. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law.
[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law,

* WARNING: THIS 15 AN UNOFFICIAL, INTRODUCTORY COPY OF THE BILL
TIE OFFICIAL COPY CONSIDERED BY THE CITY COUNCIL 1S THE FIRST READER COPY,

dirl7-01 1 3~intre 01 Fehl?
BFR IRC a3 me



Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems
[Sections 605 to 608 {As in IFC}]
SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS
605.1 TO 605.10 {45 INIFC}
605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {4S IN IFC}
605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS, {4SINIFC}
605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {48 INIFC}

605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Sections)
§§ 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5,

EXCEPTION: [These requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.)
INOT ADOPTED}

605.11.1.2.1 10 605.1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS. {ASINIFC}
605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. {4S IN IFC}

SECTIONS 606 TO 608 {AS INIFC}

CommenT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by 1FC
§ 605.11 {*Solar photovohaic power systems™}. Both of these scctions have been
incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City’s BFR Codes, including the
current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an “Errata” that, among other
things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC.
Presumably, it did this in reliance on - and to avoid unduc redundancy with -- the like
requirenients already imposed by IFC § 605.11. Unlortunately, the persons responsible
for this *Errata” scem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1.2, which (as
shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic
systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structurces designed and constructed
in accordance with the International Residential Code”. This correction repeals that
exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections — for
allf Group R-3 buildings, including those structures governed by the IRC.

Part X. International Residential Code
§ 10-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

dirl7.0113-mtro 01Fchl 7 2
BFR IRC a3 me = -



Chapter 3. Building Planning

SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES. ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RIGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC.

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

1. THE BALTIMORE CITY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFACE AREAS MUST RE

FROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

l. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURB, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADJOINING PROPERTY.

CoMMENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adoption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception I). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf, e.g., RC § 404.6 {*Underpinning”};
RC § 310.1 {*Roofiop ... Structures”}. More recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112 {*Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces"},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance

are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30" day
after the date it is enacted.

dlr17-0113 -intro HIFeb17 3
BFR JRC.a2 me 2ty



i




FLN Y

\D GO ~1 Oy La

10

12
13
14

15
16

17

18

19

20

21
22

CITY OF BALTIMORE
ORDINANCE
Council Bill 17-0017

Introduced by: The Council President

At the request of: The Administration (Department of Housing and Community Development)
Introduced and read first time: February 6, 2017
Assipned to: Judiciary and Legislative Investipations Committee

Committee Report: Favorable
Council action: Adopted
Read second time: February 27, 2017

AN ORDINANCE CONCERNING
Building, Fire, and Related Codes — International Residential Code — Corrections

FOR the purpose of expressly continuing the regulation of solar photovoltaic power systems for
all 1- and 2-family dwellings; and expressly reinstating the application of certain regulations
governing driveways and other paved surfaces for all 1- and 2-family dwellings.

BY repealing and reordaining, with amendments
Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 8-102 (FC § 605.11.1.2)

Baltimore City Revised Code
(2015 Edition)

BY adding

Article - Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Section 10-102 (RC § 327)

Baltimore City Revised Code

(2015 Edition)

SECTION 1. BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF BALTIMORE, That the
Laws of Baltimore City read as follows:

Baltimore City Revised Code
Article — Building, Fire, and Related Codes
Part VIII. International Fire Code
§ 8-102. City modifications.

The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
follows:

EXPLANATION: CAPITALS indicate matter added to existing law
[Brackets] indicate matter deleted from existing law.
Underlining indicates matter added to the bill by amendment.

Gtrikeout indicates matter stricken from the bill by
amendment or deleted from existing law by amendment

dir| 7-0113=3rd22Feb1 7
BFR/cb{7-0017-3rd/aa:nbr



Council Bill 17-0017

1 Chapter 6. Building Services and Systems

[ ]

[Sections 605 to 608 {As in IFC})

i SECTION 605 ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT, WIRING AND HAZARDS

4 605.1 TO 605.10 {ASINIFC}
5 605.11 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS. {48 INIFC}
6 605.11.1 ACCESS AND PATHWAYS. {ASINIFC}
7 605.11.1.1 ROOF ACCESS POINTS. {ASINIFC}
8 605.11.1.2 SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS FOR GROUP R-3 BUILDINGS. Solar
9 photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with [Sections]
10 §6 605.11.1.2.1 through 605.11.1.2.5.
11 EXCEPTION: [These requirements shall not apply to structures designed and
12 constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code.]
13 {NOT ADOPTED}
14 605.11.1.2.1 TO 605.1.2.5 {ASINIFC}
113 605.11.1.2 GROUND-MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC ARRAYS. {AS INIFC}
16 605.12 ABANDONED WIRING IN PLENUMS. [ASINIFC}

17 SECTIONS 606 TO 608 {ASINIFC}

18 CoMMENT: For several years, IRC § 324.7 parroted requirements also covered by IFC
19 § 605.11 {“Solar photovoltaic power systems”™}. Both of these sections have been

20 incorporated by reference, without modification, into the City’s BFR Codes, including the
21 current 2015 Edition. Recently, however, the ICC posted an *Frrata” that, among other
22 things, “deleted” IRC § 324.7, in its entirety, from the ICC’s 2015 Edition of the IRC.

23 Presumably, it did this in reliance on — and to avoid undue redundancy with -- the like

24 requirements already imposed by IFC § 605.11, Unfortunately, the persons responsible
25 for this “Errata’ seem to have overlooked the Exception to IFC § 605.11.1.2, which (as
26 shown above) provides that the section’s requirements governing solar photovoltaic

27 systems for Group R-3 buildings “shall not apply to structures designed and constructed
28 in accordance with the International Residential Code”. This correction repeals that

29 exception, thereby continuing the requirements — and their consequent protections - for
30 all Group R-3 buildings, including those structures governed by the IRC.

31 Part X. International Residential Code

32 §10-102. City modifications.

33

34 The additions, deletions, amendments, and other modifications adopted by the City are as
35 follows:

aiel 7-0113-3r22Febl? 2
BFR/eb17-0017-3rd/as nbe - -



13

14

15
16
17

18

19
20

21

22
23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32
33

34
35
36

37
38

Council Bill 17-0017

Chapter 3. Building Planning
SECTION 327 DRIVEWAYS AND OTHER PAVED SURFACES

327.1 DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES., ALL DRIVEWAY ENTRANCES LOCATED ON A PUBLIC RiGHT-
OF-WAY MUST BE CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES, REGULATIONS, AND
PERMIT REQUIREMENTS OF THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION.

327.2 SURFACE PAVING. PARKING PADS, DRIVEWAYS, AND PRIVATE ROADS MUST BE PAVED
WITH ASPHALT, BRICK, CONCRETE, MACADAM, OR STONE BLOCK. PERMEABLE PAVING
SYSTEMS MAY BE UTILIZED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS. ALL PAVING MUST BE ABLE TO SUPPORT THE DESIGN
LOADS FOR THE PROPOSED VEHICULAR TRAFFIC,

327.3 PARKING AREAS. THE SIZE, LAYOUT, AND ARRANGEMENT OF PARKING AREAS MUST
COMPLY WITH:

1. THE BALTIMORE CiTY ZONING CODE, AND
2. THE RULES AND REGULATIONS OF THE CITY PLANNING COMMISSION.

327.4 SURFACE DRAINAGE. STORM DRAINAGE OFF PAVED SURFAGE AREAS MUST BE
PROPERLY CONVEYED TO PAVED ALLEYS, PAVED STREETS, OR OTHER APPROVED WATER
COURSES.

3112.6.1 LIMITATIONS. NO DRAINAGE MAY BE DISCHARGED:

1. SO AS TO RUN OR FLOW OVER ANY SIDEWALK OR FOOTWAY, EXCEPT AT A
DRIVEWAY WITH A DEPRESSED CURB, OR

2. ACROSS ANY ADJOQINING PROPERTY.

CoMMENT: The City first adopted the IRC in its 2007 Edition of the City’s BFR Codes.
Until then, the IBC generally applied to all structures, including 1- and 2-family
dwellings. In 2007, contemporaneous with the adaption of the IRC, the IBC was
amended to exclude from its scope those 1- and 2-family dwellings newly governed by
the IRC. See BC § 101.2 (Exception 1). Instead, various uniquely local BC provisions
not otherwise addressed by the IRC, but long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
were amended into the local RC by reference. Cf, e.g., RC § 404.6 {“Underpinning”};
RC §910.1 {*Rooftop ... Structures”}. Maore recently, it was discovered that one set of
local BC provisions (BC § 3112{“Parking Lots, Driveways, and Other Paved Surfaces”},
relevant portions of which have also been long applicable to 1- and 2-family dwellings,
was inadvertently overlooked. This section corrects that oversight by expressly
incorporating those relevant portions into the RC

SECTION 2. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That the catchlines contained in this Ordinance
are not law and may not be considered to have been enacted as a part of this or any prior
Ordinance.

SECTION 3. AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, That this Ordinance takes effect on the 30™ day
after the date it is enacted.

dir] 7-0153-3rd22Febl 7 3
BFR/ch]7-0057-3rd/aanbr )



Council Bill 17-0017

Certified as duly passed this dayof

President, Baltimore City Council

Certified as duly delivered to Her Honor, the Mayor

thi day of _

~ ChiefClerk

Approved this

Mo Baltiniors City




